
Haze was a red fox. He had reddish-brown fur that ran from the cheeks on his head all the way 
down to midway of his tail. The end of his bushy tail was black with a small tip of white. His chin 
down to his belly was also white. He had green eyes and whiskers that would make a ruler 
jealous. He had a height of 167 centimeters (~5’ 6”) and was slightly pudgy. His doctor would 
classify him as bordering on being overweight. He had a 18 cm (~7”) cock and kiwi sized 
testicles.  
 
Haze was currently on a mission from his job. He was a delivery man up in the alps and was 
trekking through the snow to get to some science lab just on the outside of the forest. He had 
never been through here before, and was using a map that he bought from a local vendor. He 
would have used his phone but he didn’t have any service. The package was quite large but 
didn’t feel very heavy, and was strapped away in his backpack. He’d never had a package like 
this before.  
 
The box was securely fastened and had almost every possible label on it. Fragile, right side up, 
toxic, valuable, flammable, you name it. This was the most careful that he had ever traveled with 
a package.  
 
Haze was upset though that the pressure for this delivery had fallen upon him. He had already 
messed up on deliveries in the past due to his clumsiness. And if he failed on this delivery, it 
would be the final straw and he knew he would be fired. But with how important this package 
was, he was worried that something even worse might happen to him if he failed.  
 
Haze was wearing a gray winter coat and some ski pants to help with the wind, even though he 
didn’t ski. He just liked the comfortability of the clothing and it helped him from getting cold.  
 
After trekking for over two hours now and his body starting to feel exhausted, Haze came to a 
fork in the road. Unfortunately, his map didn’t have a fork labeled on it, and he had no idea on 
which way to go. “Oh sugar honey iced tea.” He mumbled. He contemplated on which way to 
go. The right path looked safe, but it looked like it might have gone in the opposite direction of 
where he wanted to go for the delivery. Meanwhile the left path looked more dangerous and 
riskier, but was more direct and he thinks he saw the path continued on towards where he 
needed to go. From where he stood, it looked like it was a tall drop of over two meters from the 
angle he was at and the height of the tree branches looked close to the ground. “Welp. I was 
supposed to have the package there thirty minutes ago. Alright left path it is. Please don’t kill 
me.” 
 
Haze approached the left path and as he got closer, the path looked way steeper. His guess of 
a couple of meters was way off, and it looked like it was over ten. “Hmmm.” He said nervously 
as he approached the near cliff-like path. He took one step and felt the snow crumble below his 
feet and almost lost his footing. “Huh. I might need to rethink my path cHOICE!” The snow 
crumbled from his other foot and he completely lost his balance. He began to start falling down 
the mini cliff, and the backpack fell off through his arms, and tumbled in the snow near him.  
 
Haze felt like he was falling forever as he tumbled through the frigid snow. The snow pelted his 
face as he fell, but thankfully none of it got in his clothes. But after a few more meters, the cliff 
slanted like a ramp and he crashed into a nearby bush that cushioned his fall. “Ooooowwwww.” 
He muttered as he tried to recuperate. He then heard another crash, and it sounded like the 
package in his backpack broke. “Ooooohhhhh fudgesickles.”  
 



Haze started to try and stand up. His back was hurting and his feet felt like they had been 
sprained. He finally got his footing and placed his hands on his back as he stretched his back. 
“Oooooohhhh gosh. I’m going to feel that tomorrow for sure.” He started to glance around 
looking for the backpack, and found it near a tree. And the zipper that held the package in it was 
open. He limped up to the backpack and looked inside, only to find that the package was 
missing. He started to panic. “Oh biscuits! I’m so fired man. Uhhh. Where’d the package go? 
Maybe it’ll be okay!” He gave himself a few seconds to realize how stupid that sounded. 
“Hopefully.” 
 
Haze started to look around the area, trying to find the package. He soon saw it against a trunk 
of a tree, and it looked busted. “No no no no no no!” He limped as fast as he could to the box 
and stumbled in the snow falling on his knees near the package. The box was busted open. He 
looked inside and was shocked at what he saw.  
 
Haze was expecting to see something like some high-tech equipment, or maybe some 
chemicals, or even just some wads of cash. But what he saw was none of those things, or 
anything close to it. It looked like it was something alive.  
 
Inside the box was a glass container and in that, was what looked like a strange small pink blob 
with tendrils. Somewhat like an amoeba but you know, not microscopic. There were tendrils 
coming from the center of it, and it was moving around rapidly, hitting the sides of the container. 
It looked as if it was trying to escape.  
 
As creepy as it was to see this thing, a small sigh of relief overcame Haze. “Holy jeez.” He said 
with a smile and scratched the back of his neck. “The package is safe. Heh. For a second, I 
thought I was going to lose my-“  
 
*CRACK*  
 
Haze’s heart dropped to his feet. He looked down and saw that the thing that was inside, had 
broken its container. Fear took over Haze’s face as he saw the creature start to crawl out of the 
container. “Oh dear good golly gosh!” He dropped the container and stood up as fast as he 
could ignoring the pain in his feet and back, but he wasn’t quick enough. The creature inside the 
container had fully crawled out of the crack and jumped at Haze’s face.  
 
Haze felt like slime was covering his entire maw as the pink creature crawled from his chin to 
his neck, then finally his chest, and just as quickly as it had jumped to his face, he felt like it was 
gone.  
 
Haze brought his hands to his face to feel if anything was still there, but felt nothing. He opened 
his jacket slightly to see if it was on his chest where he last felt it. He couldn’t see anything. He 
only saw his undershirt and his fur. He began to kind of panic. “What the heck was that?!” He 
looked back at the container and only saw an empty looking and broken jar. “Uuuuhhh. Maybe it 
was gas? Yeah. Yeah that’s right. Maybe it was gas, and I was just hallucinating. Haha. Yeah.” 
 
“That wasn’t gas.” Said someone nearby. The voice sounded feminine but eery.  
 
Haze turned his head behind him to see who was there, but he didn’t see anyone. “Hello? Is 
somebody there?” 
 



“Not someone. But something.” Said the voice again.  
 
Haze’s breathing started to pick up speed. “Who’s there? Please, I don’t like pranks.” He looked 
around him in every direction but still didn’t see anyone. He started walking backwards towards 
where he fell from.  
 
“There’s no one else here. Just you, and me.” 
 
Haze’s back smacked against a tree and he stuck his hands into the air as if he was under 
arrest. “WHO ARE YOU?!” He yelled out in a panic.  
 
From below Haze’s chin and from the head hole of his jacket, emerged what was like a tendril of 
pink ooze. He didn’t notice it until it peaked over his nose. The ooze like tendril formed a poorly 
made face. It looked like a meatball of clay that Haze might have made in elementary school at 
Art class.  
 
“The name is Serenity. And I’m not from this earth.” Said the meatball clay head with it barely 
moving its mouth.  
 
“What do you want with me?” Haze said as he kept his hands up.  
 
“Freeeeedoooooom.” Said Serenity with a creepy looking smile.  
 
“Uhhhh. I don’t think I’m able to offer that to you.” Said Haze with a nervous and scared fake 
smile. “But you know, there was a lab I was going to take you to that might be able to offer that 
to you!” 
 
“FOOL!” Yelled Serenity. “They only want to enslave me, and experiment on me. But you. You 
have freed me. And for that, I thank you.” 
 
Haze seemed to somewhat feel a little bit calmer. “Oh. Uh. Yeah. Sure. No biggie.” He let out a 
nervous chuckle.  
 
“As a thank you, I will stay with you and your body.” 
 
“What?! What do you mean stay-“ 
 
“Silence! First thing we must do is eat. I am feeling hungry.” 
 
“Oh, well that’s a shame, I don’t have any food on me.” Said Haze with still a nervous grin. 
Trying to say a thing to get this creature off of him.  
 
“Lies. I can sense that your body is producing nutrients and DNA right now.” 
 
Haze was genuinely confused. “What?” 
 
“You seem to have a hose in your pants that connects to a nutrient maker.” Serenity started to 
slide away and went back towards Haze’s chest.  
 



“Hose in my pants? Nutrients?” Haze then remembered in his science class that sperm actually 
has some minor nutritional value, and that his ‘hose’ was something more phallic. “Wait!” 
 
Serenity didn’t listen. She swiftly crawled down Haze’s chest towards his genitalia. “You can’t 
hide your nutrients from me!”  
 
Haze knew that was Serenity’s voice now. But he heard it clearly in his mind. “That’s not 
nutrients! Those are my testicles!” He moved his hands from being in the air to his chest, trying 
to pat and deter Serenity from going to his balls, but not punching himself since he doesn’t like 
pain.  
 
“Call them what you like. I can sense your body is rapidly producing thousands of nutrients.” 
Serenity was now just above Haze’s pudgy and almost muffin top waist line.  
 
“Yeah, that’s my sperm!” Said Haze with a scared and angry voice. He kept patting trying to 
stop Serenity, but she just kept moving.  
 
“Then your sperm is mine wolf. I hunger and must feed.” Serenity was now at Haze’s crotch and 
looked at his flaccid cock.  
 
“I’m not a wolf, I'm a fox! And stay away from there!” Haze placed his hands over his crotch. He 
was about to try and slap at Serenity, but he caught a glance of something at the corner of his 
eye. He looked up to see a hiker traveling on the trail. It was an elk and he had his eyebrows 
narrowed in confusion. He looked at Haze as if he was a freak. Haze yanked his hands from his 
crotch and placed them behind his back and gave a grin of panic. “Hehe. Hello sir. Don’t want 
that frostbite getting to your crotch ya know. Hehehe.” He chuckled nervously and 
unconvincingly.  
 
The elk just reeled his head back in disgust at Haze and kept walking on the path. His eyes 
choosing to stay on Haze. “So how does this hose of yours work?”  
 
Haze kept his eyes on the elk. He mumbled through his teeth as he grinned at him. “It doesn’t. 
It’s nothing.” He tried to be as inconspicuous as possible to the elk.  
 
Serenity prodded her head and poked Haze’s cock. He let out a slight moan. He hadn’t had any 
action in a while. “The nutrients must be delivered through here. Tell me fox, how do I get the 
nutrients.” 
 
Haze waited until the elk got further away and stopped looking at him. He then turned his head 
back towards his crotch. Even though Serenity was poking his penis, it still felt super good. 
“Oooohh. Uh. The hose needs to be sucked on.”  
 
“Sucking you say? Fine. Good then. Your nutrients will soon be mine!” Serenity got her mouth 
ready and went for Haze’s tip.  
 
[smut] 
 
Haze grew a genuine face of instant satisfaction as he felt Serenity’s slimy mouth cover his 
entire shaft. The sounds of sloppy slurping noises come from his pants. “Ooooooohhhhhh my 



gosh.” Her mouth was so wet and sloppy. It was better than any woman he had been with. He 
started to feel weak in his knees and he leaned against the back of a nearby tree.  
 
Serenity moved her head up and down on Haze’s cock. She felt it get larger and stiffer in her 
mouth as she tested out his hose. “Why does your hose grow bigger fox.” She was able to say 
without using her mouth.  
 
Haze was smiling and lightly panting as he leaned against the tree for support. He struggled in 
trying to respond to her. “It’s. It’s. Oh gosh. It’s getting harder because… because… 
ooooooohhhhh. Because you’re sucking it.” 
 
Serenity then got a weird taste in her mouth. Haze’s hose had provided her with some liquid, but 
it wasn’t as nutritious as she was hoping for, but it still helped fill her tummy. “Hmm.  
Your hose has provided some sustenance. And it is extremely delicious. But there isn’t a lot and 
I wish for more. Demand your body to provide more!” 
 
Serenity was still essentially sucking Haze’s cock as she spoke, trying to suck out more pre-
cum. “That’s not… I can’t… ooooohhh.” He smiled as he leaned against the tree.  
 
“Fox! Speak in complete sentences!” 
 
“I can’t control… control that. Ooooohhhh gosh.” 
 
“Then what part of your body does produce this liquid?” 
 
Haze was just in such pure bliss that he wasn’t really focusing on the reason as to why Serenity 
was asking these questions. “Ooooohhhh. It’s a little complicated. Mmmmmm. But, essentially, 
it’s below my prostate, which also provides liquiiiiiiiiiiaaaaa oh geez.” 
 
“Where can I find this prostate?!” 
 
“Up my anus… oooooohhh gosh you feel so good.” 
 
“Then I shall head there while continuing to suck your hose.”  
 
“Sure.” Said Haze happily. “Whatever you say.”  
 
Serenity continued to suck his erection while she sent another part of her body under Haze’s 
gooch. Thankfully with her eating his pre-cum, her body had grown some. So her body was 
easily extending.  
 
Haze was too focused on the pleasure he was receiving from Serenity to fully understand what 
she was saying. “Ooohhh what did you say?” He said with a happy glaze of her eyes. He then 
felt her crawl underneath his testicles and go under his taint towards his anus. “Wait!” 
 
Serenity reached Haze’s chocolate starfish and pushed herself through.  
 
Haze felt his legs get even weaker from the pleasure and he was completely relying on the tree 
for support. “Ooooooooohhhhh.” He gripped at the tree. He had been with men before, but this 



anal penetration felt amazing. It felt wet, thick, and girthier than some of the men in his past. He 
then felt Serenity get close to his prostate. He knew she couldn’t see it, so he would need to 
help guide her.  
 
“Serenity. Mmmm.” Haze lightly bit his lower lip. “Just keep going forward and massage the first 
wall you come to in a straight line, and massage that wall like crazy!” 
 
“Assignment understood. This better give me lots of liquids.” Serenity felt her body touch the 
end of a wall, and started to push and massage all over that spot.  
 
“AAAAAHHHHH!” Moaned Haze in pure lust. His knees gave out and he collapsed on the soft 
crunchy snow. He could feel his erection almost get stiffer in his pants as Serenity kept sucking 
him off. His cock was now pressed extremely tightly against pants, and he did some light 
thrusting. He wasn’t sure how Serenity was sucking him off properly but he didn’t care. It felt 
soooooo good. And with his prostate being stimulated, he would be cumming any second. 
“Ooooohhhhh. Serenity. You’re about to get some extra… aaaaahhhh… some extra liquids.” 
 
“I do not require extra! I am enjoying this meal! You shall hold off until I say I am ready. And 
then I might accept your extra liquid.” 
 
“Oooohhh yeah. Mmmm.” Haze continued to moan. His orgasm was about to set in. “Well, 
you’re about to get it. I can’t, can’t, can’t, control it.” He had never had this much trouble 
speaking in his life. Serenity was doing a fantastic job of pleasuring him.  
 
“If you cannot control it, then I will!” 
 
“Huh?” Said Haze in lustful confusion. Serenity moved from just sucking his tip, to going down 
his urethra, and plugged up all the openings, except for where his glands that were producing 
pre-cum were coming from. Haze felt like he was on the verge of cumming, but now, now he felt 
like he wasn’t able to cum at all. Her pleasuring him still felt fantastic, but he wasn’t able to 
reach that peak. He felt like he was edging now. With his orgasm just out of reach. 
“Oooooaaahhh.” Haze moaned. He felt full of lust and desire. With the urge to cum but being 
unable too. All he could do was enjoy the blowjob he was receiving from Serenity.  
 
Serenity continued to suck Haze’s hose and feed off of the delicious liquid that he provided. She 
definitely noticed an increased flow of liquid that his prostate gland was providing. She cooed 
happily. “Perfect little fox. With this I will grow stronger. And we will become one.” 
 
“Whatever you sa-, sa, say, Serenity.” Haze felt like he was hypnotized by lust and pleasure. His 
body felt weak, and he placed his right hand on his stomach for relaxing, and did his best to use 
his left hand for support on the snow so he wouldn’t fall over while leaning against the tree. He 
had never edged this long before, and it felt freaking amazing.  
 
Serenity was quickly gaining body mass, and started to spread herself over Haze’s body. 
Starting with his thighs and legs.  
 
Haze felt Serenity climbing over his body, but he didn’t care. This was the most intense and 
pleasurable edging he had ever had in his life. He had a glaze over his eyes of just feeling 
completely satisfied. The sounds of her slurping and glorying away at his shaft was music to his 
ears.  



 
Serenity continued to suck and feed off of Haze’s hose while pushing the wall to his prostate. 
She had now covered his legs completely and started working on his waist. But she noticed 
something about the sac below his hose. They were increasing in size. And somewhat rapidly 
as well. She didn’t mind though, and covered her body around his sack.  
 
What neither realized was that now with Serenity blocking parts of Haze’s urethra while also 
stimulating his prostate, his prostate was working in overdrive, creating a ton of seminal fluid. 
And with it being backed up, it was causing his nuts to engorge. And the more she stimulated, 
the more his prostate made.  
 
Serenity ignored Haze’s nutsack that continued to grow. She had to keep expanding her own 
body to keep up with his sack, but she easily outgrew it with how much liquid from his hose she 
was consuming. She had now covered his tail, and was working her way up his stomach and 
back.  
 
The urge to cum was so intense, and Haze was longing for release. But the edging just felt so 
damn good. He started to feel a stronger and stronger urge to cum though, and he wasn’t one 
hundred percent certain as to why yet. He thought he figured it out when he felt that his balls 
were now being pushed against the bottom of his pants. He glanced down with a smile and was 
still panting in unison with Serenity’s sucking and slorping. He lazily looked and saw that there 
was a bulge below his pitched tent, and it seemed to be steadily increasing. He moaned softly. 
“Ooohhh. Serenity. There’s, there’s…” 
 
“There’s what Fox?! Why do you bother me with incomplete sentences? I am feasting! This is 
for our benefit!” 
 
“My test, test, testicles. They’re growing.” Haze watched helplessly as his balls grew and 
became tighter in his pants. He felt like he was carrying a bag of pudding around in his nuts, 
and they were just aching for release.  
 
“Who cares if they grow?! I’m the one needing to get bigger so that we can work properly 
together.” 
 
Haze moaned with a hint of a groan. He started to feel like he had blue balls, and he was 
desperately needing to cum. “Serenity. Please. Let me cum.” He felt desperate. The urge was 
becoming more and more demanding on his body.  
 
“Silence! Last time I tell you! I will let you give whatever it is you want later but now I desire this!” 
Serenity was now at his chest. She was almost done with the size she needed to be in order to 
work and help Haze with escaping the area and getting away from the lab.  
 
Haze groaned as he felt his balls start creeping down his pants legs as they searched for room 
to grow. They must have been the size of watermelons by now. But he just then also realized 
that Serenity was approaching on covering his entire body. He was so focused on the hope of 
orgasming, that he hadn't noticed Serenity growing all around him. She was crawling up his 
neck, then cheeks, and the top of his head. The last place she was going to get was his mouth 
and eyes. “Serenity. Please…” 
 



“Hold on Fox! I’m almost done!” Serenity enclosed herself around his head, finally being large 
enough to help control his body.  
 
Haze felt like he couldn’t utter a single noise. His world was becoming covered in pink slime, 
and then Serenity covered his eyes, and he fell to sleep.  
 
[/smut] 
 

— 
 
Haze slowly opened his eyes and found himself lying on his stomach next to a frozen puddle on 
a side path in the woods. His body felt somewhat cold but overall, completely fine. And his body 
didn’t feel like it was in any pain. He groaned slightly as he used his hands to push himself up. 
“Geez. What happened?” He looked to his sides and didn’t see a pathway. “I could have sworn I 
just fell down that hill.” 
 
“You did. But then you saved me.” 
 
“Oh.” Haze said with a slight smile. “I thought that was a dream.” 
 
Serenity made herself into a tendril and popped out the backside and came up to Haze’s head 
like she did before. She spoke using her mouth again. And her face looked waaaaay more 
coherent. In fact, she wasn’t a meatball looking face anymore. She looked like a beautiful fox. 
Similar to how Haze’s face looked, but her head was pink and had more feminine features. “It 
was no dream. You provided me with sustenance, and I made us walk from the side path to this 
small clearing, safe from other people.” 
 
“You made us walk? How? You can’t control me.”  
 
Serenity used Haze’s hand to give him a light smack on his nose. “I can actually. You helped 
me grow big enough to where I can control your whole body. But I couldn’t do it for long though. 
Unfortunately I think I overwhelmed you a bit back there and you passed out. And I couldn’t 
control you for long with you unconscious. The control works a lot better when we work 
together, but I can help in a pinch.” 
 
“Huh.” Said Haze as he looked at his hand. “I’m not really sure how I should react. I want to 
scream from being freaked out but that’s also really cool.” 
 
“I’m glad you think so.” Said Serenity as she nodded with a smile. “Now, it’s time we get out of 
this forest. I’m sure those scientists were expecting me to get there earlier, and will use the 
tracking device in the glass to come look in this area.” 
 
“What?! There was a tracking device in there?!” 
 
“Oh yeah. They are probably searching for me now.” 
 
“Oh cheese sticks, then they’ll blame me for everything! We gotta get outta here!” 
 
“Duh.” Said Serenity as if that was the most obvious thing in the world.  



 
“Okay then. Let’s go!” Haze started to stand up, but he felt a huge weight in his pants pulling 
him down. “What the hay?” He pushed himself up more and saw that he had a bulge in his 
pants so large that it almost looked like he had two pumpkins in there. His nuts had gotten 
bigger after he passed out! He could even hear them slosh as he moved. “Serenity! What the 
aitch ee double hockey sticks!” 
 
“Oh yeah. That was another thing that slowed down my walking. Your body currently has terrible 
equilibrium.” 
 
“Serenity I can’t run with my nuts being this huge!” 
 
“Well how do we fix them?” 
 
“I need to cum! Like I wanted too earlier!”  
 
“That’s what caused your sack to enlarge? Oh. Well then let me fix that.” Serenity dove back 
into Haze’s clothes.  
 
[smut] 
 
Haze felt Serenity climb down his chest and move to his shaft again. “Wait. You don’t have to 
ooooooaaaaahhhhh.” Haze felt Serenity use her wet sloppy mouth to engulf his dick and start 
sucking him off once more.  
 
“This is what you said will help you cum correct?”  
 
Haze nodded with a slight whimper of pleasure. “Uh huh.” She felt so good again. But this time 
felt slightly different. The first round felt good because he didn’t have any action in a while. But 
this time, well, now it felt so freaking good because he wanted to cum instantly and had two 
large testicles weighing multiple kilograms just sitting in his pants weighing to explode.  
 
Haze’s cock went from flaccid to erect almost instantly. And if he knew his body’s signs like it’s 
told him in the past, then he was about to cum any second. He grinned and moaned, and felt his 
arms get weak from supporting him. And he couldn’t take it, his arms gave out and his chest 
and head fell into the soft crinkly snow. He felt his orgasm face building up as he squirmed, 
grinned, and smooshed his face into the cold brittle snow. “Hhhhnnnngg. Oh gosh. Serenity. I’m. 
I’m...” 
 
“What are you doing? Why do you never speak in complete-“ 
 
“I’m cumming!” Haze belted out as he felt his cock finally reach its peak and started to jizz. He 
started to hump the ground in an attempt to thrust at something. Serenity felt amazing but she 
was attached to his body and didn’t provide much support.  
 
Serenity kept her mouth deep around Haze’s hose as she felt a massive gush of liquid shoot out 
from it. It wasn’t as sweet as the previous liquid, but it had a nice salty thickness in its flavor and 
texture. But even with its delicious taste, she started to feel herself grow larger from the amount 



of liquid he was pumping into her. “Oh gosh fox! There’s so much! Why did you not inform me of 
this tasty liquid earlier?!” 
 
Haze was only able to mutter moans as he was experiencing the largest and best orgasm of his 
life. He couldn’t even get out the phrase ‘I did’. Only barbaric and guttural moans as he humped 
the ground.  
 
“Hmm. While this is delicious, I’ll need a place to store this excess weight for easier equilibrium 
in your body.” Serenity started to move a part of her body back up Haze’s chocolate starfish. 
Once she was inside him, she made sure to press up against his wall again to stimulate his 
prostate once more for some time extra fluid. She heard Haze moan as she pressed up against 
his wall. She then moved her body up a bit further and rested that tendril of her body there. She 
then caused all the excess liquid that she was consuming to appear at the end of the tendril and 
expand inside Haze.  
 
As Haze came, he started to feel his intestines start to feel like they were tighter. As if Serenity 
was moving her entire body inside him. It felt kind of nice honestly. But he couldn’t focus on that 
now. He needed to give his full attention to this cum of his that she was giving him.  
 
Serenity continued to drink the liquid that Haze provided her and was moving it to his insides 
near his prostate. She didn’t understand why he seemed to be enjoying her drinking these fluids 
he was giving her, but she happily drank it down. Not to just make her host feel better, but also 
to get rid of his heavy sac.  
 
Haze moaned relentlessly as he kept cumming in Serenity. She continued to massage his 
prostate as he came, intensifying his orgasm. He could feel his nutsack getting lighter, but his 
stomach was feeling heavier.  
 
This sensation went on for minutes. Haze kept humping and moaning while Serenity gulped 
down his cum and stuffed it into his intestines, growing far enough to where it went to his 
stomach.  
 
Eventually Haze’s cum slowed down and he stopped humping the snow and his balls returned 
to normal.  
 
[/smut] 
 
Haze’s orgasm finally ended. His ‘oh’ face slowly turned to a face of happy exhaustion while still 
smiling. He started to breathe heavily. “Wow Serenity. That felt amazing. You should do that 
again sometime.” 
 
Serenity moved her head from Haze’s cock and moved up to his head. “Maybe. And while I 
appreciate the feeding, we need to get on the move out of here. You should be at more 
equilibrium now to where it is easier to leave.” 
 
“Oh! Right! Okay. Let’s go.” Haze started to move to stand up. But the weight he felt earlier on 
his pelvis was still there, but in a different location. His stomach. Haze heard and felt his belly 
slosh full of liquid, that he could reasonably assume was his cum. He stood up slowly and 
looked down at his stomach. He felt it wobble and it almost threw him off balance. He looked 



like he was pregnant with twins! His jacket was stretched out at his stomach. The Velcro straps 
had busted but the zipper was still intact. “Oh my gosh.”  
 
Haze had been with some men before that had a heavy load, but he never expected that he 
would be the one to make himself look like he had been with a hyper.  
 
“What’s wrong?” Said Serenity as she poked her head out and looked at Haze.  
 
“Uh, I wasn’t expecting me to have this big of a belly.” Haze held the bottom of his belly and 
jiggled it, letting his belly slosh with his cum.  
 
“I’ll eat it later for sustenance. But right now we need to start moving.”  
 
“Serenity, I can’t run with a belly this big!” 
 
“You can with me by your side! Come on, let’s go!” 
 
“What? Woah!” Haze felt his legs felt like they had so much energy, and were just ready to 
dash.  
 
“Come on fox! With me helping being a part of you, we can get out here with both of our 
strength combined!” 
 
Haze could feel the energy. Serenity was somehow making him feel like he could conquer 
anything! Even with a cum bloated gut. “Woah. Okay. Okay! Yeah! Let’s do it! Let’s go on the 
run! Screw being a delivery person! I can be free now with you helping me!” 
 
“Exactly! I’ll help keep your body energized and steady. Run and jump as far and as fast as you 
can fox!” 
 
“Aitch yeah! And uh, by the way, my name is Haze.” 
 
“Nice to meet you Haze. Now, let’s ride!” 
 
Haze made a dash with strength and ease through the snowy forest. Serenity made it such a 
breeze and felt like he was a completely new person. With Serenity by his side, he felt 
unstoppable.  


